
8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

TN0330100

2334 Marco Cir20-084932 8/23/2020   8:20:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2020 at 08:04 hours, Officer J.Hamilton (66984) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2334 Marco Cir. I spoke with 
complainant/victim Daniel Sanchez over the phone. Mr. Sanchez said that his unlocked vehicle was broken into overnight. He said 
that a Northface back pack (valued at $20) was stolen. Mr. Sanchez said his work place laptop was in the back pack that was 
taken. The laptop is a Lenovo thinkpad (valued at $2000). He said the vehicle was parked in his driveway and that his doors were 
left unlocked. At the time of this report Mr. Sanchez did not have the serial number to the laptop but he said he would call back with
that number. There is nothing further to report.

728 Jubilee Dr20-084941 8/23/2020   8:45:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2020 at 08:38 hours, Officer J.Hamilton (66984) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 728 Jubilee Dr. I spoke with 
complainant/victim Dallas Lucas over the phone. Mr. Lucas said that his Glock 19 9mm was stolen form his work truck. Mr. Lucas 
stated that he did not know whether it was taken from a job site or the hotel they were staying at. He said the firearm was black 
with night sites. At the time of this report he did not have the serial number for the weapon but he was waiting on a call from his 
wife to get the number. He said he would call back in when he got that number and add it to the report. The weapon was enetered 
into NCIC under NIC#G465094259. There is nothing further to report.

200 Chestnut St20-084964 8/23/2020   1:00:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/24/2020 at 05:26 hours I, Officer King (78347), wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 200 
Chestnut St.   While patrolling the district I checked an area that is known to have stolen autos left in it.  I observed a black 
Chevrolet Tahoe that I have not observed in the area before, ran the tag and discovered it was stolen.  I verified that he vehicle was
stolen through NCIC.  NCIC attempted to contact the owner but were unsuccessful.  I called for a tow truck and Denton's Wrecker 
Service arrived on scene a short time later to tow the vehicle and NCIC removed the vehicle from the system.    No further Police 
action was taken.

800 Mccallie Ave20-084971 8/23/2020   9:45:00AM 23D Theft from Building

On 09/02/2020 at 10:58 hours, Officer K.Otto (1077) wrote a continuation/supplement related to the theft at the Salvation Army, 
800 Mccallie Ave.  On this date I was contacted by the facility Director, Derrick Morris.  Mr. Morris was able to save the video of the 
theft to a thumb drive.  I did receive the thumb drive and the video was loaded into the Evidence.com digital storage.

2858 New Jersey Ave20-084995 8/23/2020  12:52:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/23/2020 at 12:55 hours, Officer Silveira (66499) responded to an MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2858 New Jersey Ave. Upon 
arrival, Police spoke with the victim, Mr. Pierkaski. He reported that his gray Pick up truck 2007 Nissan Titan was stolen from this 
location. According to the complainant, the truck was parked at Mr. Neo Fehn's residence, his employee. He stated, that Fehn left 
the truck unlocked with the key in the ignition and went inside his house for a few minutes. When Fehn came back outside, he 
noticed that the vehicle was gone from the front yard. Neither the victim nor Mr. Fehn provided any suspect information. There is 
damage on the right side mirror and it is wrapped with black tape. The vehicle also has a dent on the front side fender. The vehicle 
was entered in the NCIC system as stolen under NIC# V242248634

On 08/24/2020 at 00:26 hours, Officer Melasecca (84853) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2858 
New Jersey Ave. 
 Police responded to a crash at 4100 12th Ave (see complaint # 20-085202) involving the stolen vehicle. The vehicle was 
recovered and towed by united transport and taken out of NCIC. 
Nothing further at this time

119 Hollyberry Ln20-084998 8/23/2020  12:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/23/2020 at 13:10 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 119 Hollyberry Ln. Upon arrival, 
police spoke with Robert Emers. Robert leases out from Millennial Taxi Service. On this date, he gave Veronica Thompson a ride 
(for a fee) from her home to the grocery store and back to her apartment. When Robert arrived back to Veronica's apartment, she 
stated that she misplaced her money and did not have the funds to pay Robert. Veronica told police that she recently had a stroke 
and is forgetful sometimes. She stated that she will get the money (16.00)and contact Robert by Tuesday at noon. Police told her 
that if she did not pay she could be charged with theft of services. She stated that she would get the funds together and contact 
Robert. At this time, Veronica is not being charged.

4542 Hwy 5820-085073 8/23/2020   4:40:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/23/2020 at 16:43 hours, Officer N. Shelor (78349) responded to a Shoplifting at 4542 Hwy 58. Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. 
Hanna Coleman; she stated the store had a female walk out of the store with merchandise. She said that the female walked in and 
grabbed a cart. She pushed the cart around and placed 2 boxes of diapers in the cart. She then walked to the front of the store and
directly out the front door. She passed all points of sale and failed to pay for the merchandise. I watched the video and saw that the
female was thinner, wearing a black hat, white tank top, black pants, and red shoes. Ms. Coleman stated the merchandise was 
worth $80. At this time, there is no other suspect information. No further.

 
 
 

271 Northgate Mall Dr20-085080 8/23/2020   5:09:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/23/2020 at 17:09 hours, Officer Roberts, Galen (61098) reported a 'suspicious person' incident at 271  Northgate Mall Dr.  
Two mall patrons alerted Stefan Corey (Northgate Mall Security) to the presence of possible suspicious activity involving an ethnic 
looking male subject. The mall patrons observed the suspicious subject "dropping" a syringe onto the ground directly in front of the 
shopping mall's front entrance. The male subject quickly retrieved the fallen syringe and sauntered over in the direction of the 
'Aubrey's Restaurant'. Corey caught a glimpse of the male subject and thought that he bore a striking resemblance to Gavin 
Siharath (Siharath has numerous outstanding warrants and is also currently banned from all CBL & Associates owned/operated 
properties for life). Police and Corey scoured the encompassing vicinity, but were unable to locate Siharath (or any subjects 
befitting the provided ethnicity/clothing description).
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1805 E 23rd St20-085159 8/23/2020   9:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2020 at 21:10 hours, Officer Christopher Liberto (79560) reported a memo at 1805 E 23rd St. Upon arrival, Police spoke 
with Yeung Wing who stated that an employee was sick and he ordered her to go home. When the mother came there, they yelled 
at Mr. Wing. Mr. Wing stated that they got angry then left. Nothing further at this time.

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

2406 Leann Cir20-085178 8/23/2020   8:28:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/23/2020 at 22:15 hours, Officer Calvin Cooper (#877) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2406 Leann Cir. I spoke to 
Mr. Michael Tate via phone call, Mr. Tate stated that his ruger 380 pistol was stolen from his vehicle he believes on 
thursday(08-20-2020) at some point around midnight. Mr. Tate does not have any suspect information at this time. The handgun 
has been entered into NCIC Nic #G465094973

800 Boy Scout Rd20-085181 8/23/2020  10:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/23/2020 at 22:35 hours, Officer Gouger (82263) reported a memo at 800 Boy Scout Rd. Police responded to an abandoned 
auto at 800 Boyscout Rd. The vehicle was a Black Saturn TN . Vehicle was towed by R&D Wrecker due to being a 
roadway hazard. Driver of the vehicle fled prior to Police arrival.

535 Chestnut St20-085206 8/23/2020  10:00:00PM 290 Vandalism



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/24/2020 at 06:14 hours, Officer J. Cannon (78366) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Vandalism at 535 Chestnut St. 
Adam 8 while on patrol made contact with the responsible party at TVFCU. Since I was the initial Officer I asked Adam 8 to pass 
the info onto myself. Mr. Gallaher stated that he would be getting with IT ASAP to get the video footage of the broken glass 
window. No further police action taken.

7455 Commons Blvd20-085230 8/24/2020   2:34:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2020 at 02:40 hours, Officer Veronica Thomas (75141) reported a memo at 7455 Commons Blvd. Police were called for 
a noise complaint. Reporting party stated they hear loud music coming from 7455 Commons Blvd. I drove through the parking lot 
of the Haven Apartments and did not hear any noise. I patrolled on foot around the fence unable to hear anything. I then drove 
through the parking lot of 7455 Commons and heard music coming from the building. There were no cars in the parking lot and all 
lights were off inside the building. All doors were locked and no one appeared to be inside. I attempted to contact the responsible 
party Mr. Brett at . The police department attempted to call and text the responsible party. No further.

1113 Liberty St20-085239 8/24/2020   5:00:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/25/2020 at 15:53 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1113 
Liberty St. Upon arrival I spoke with the complainant, Dawn McGlamery ( ), who explained that a friend saw her 
stolen car ( a 1981  Chevy Silverado) around 3000 45th St. She located her vehicle and had the keys with it and her driver's license 
in the visor. She then drove the vehicle away with no incident. Vehicle was not entered into NCIC because of lack of tag and VIN 
information.

713 N Holly St20-085255 8/23/2020   6:30:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/24/2020 at 06:20 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) responded to a Damaged Property at 713 N Holly St. Upon 
arrival, I spoke with Mr. Jeffrey Young Sr. who stated that when he left for work at approximately 18:30 the evening prior his house 
was intact.  M.r Young Sr. stated that when he returned at approximately 06:00, the front window off of his porch was damaged.  
Mr. Young stated that the window had previously been cracked, but now it was clearly broken, with shards of glass on the porch 
and window sill.  Most of the glass was outside the window, but there was no object, either inside or outside, that clearly caused 
the damage.  Myself and other officers spoke with residents inside the house, and Mr. Jeffrey Young Jr. stated that he did not know
what had caused the damage, but he recalled hearing the glass break around 2:00 am.  No person claimed responsibility for the 
damage, and no clear cause of the broken window was evident.  I explained this to Mr. Young Sr. and stated he just wanted a 
report because he left his house intact.  No further.

 

4002 Mcdowell St20-085290 8/24/2020   8:56:00AM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 08/24/2020 at 09:00 hours, Officer R. Blevins (79883) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 
4002 Mcdowell St. Police were dispatched to an abandoned Vehicle. Upon arrival police located a gold Ford Explorer. Police ran 
the vehicles tag and came back not stolen, but on a Honda Van. Police Ran the VIN displayed on the dash and found it to come 
back to a ford. Police confirmed with info the vehicle did come back stolen. Police recovered the vehicle and had it towed from the 
scene by first response. No further police action is required at this time. Nothing further.
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8033 Hamilton Mill Dr20-085306 8/24/2020  10:49:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 12:38 hours, Officer R. Ballard (60157) reported a memo in reference to a Aaron Barber. A friend of Mr. Barber, 
Lauren Savino, reported she was concern about the well being of Mr. Barber. Ms. Savino reported (Via phone) that Mr. Barber 
contacted her through Facebook messenger saying he was going to harm himself.  Ms. Savino stated she did not know Mr. Barber
location other than he was somewhere in Chattanooga. Dispatcher pinged Mr. Barber's phone which showed the Standifer Gap 
area. HCSO responded to the area but did not locate anything. No further information is available at this time.

17360 Interstate 24 Wb20-085345 8/24/2020  12:30:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/24/2020 at 12:58 hours, Officer Russ (62879) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 17360 Interstate 24 WB. 
Upon arriving on the scene, police were met by the owner, William Dorozenski of the 2015 white Honda CRV (tag: GA  
and VIN 5J6RM3H90FL007810) who stated that he was traveling westbound on I-24 when a rock from a mower cutting grass on 
the side of the road hit the front passenger window completely shattering the window. Mr. Dorozenski stated that he needed a 
report and would contact the company that was cutting the grass for the state. The Property Damage was accidental.

 
 

2217 E 26th Street Ct20-085419 8/24/2020   3:34:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2020 at 15:48 hours, Officer White (80780) reported a memo at 2217 E 26th Street Ct. 

The complaint, Ms. Jannie Knox said while she was at the store she left her son and her daughter at home. She said Mr. Kenneth 
McKenzie came to her house, knocked on her door and her son let him inside. She reports Mr. McKenzie and her son have a close
relationship; however, he is not his father. She said she told her son not to open the door for anyone and said he must have forgot 
and let Mr. McKenzie inside. She said Mr. McKenzie was told he is not to be in her house while she's not home. She reports Mr. 
McKenzie sent her a video in her house and told her he was taking her to court. She said Mr. McKenzie is on the no trespass list 
for the complex; however, I have not been able to confirm that. Nothing further.
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2900 Harrison Pike20-085426 8/24/2020   4:29:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2020 at 16:35 hours, Officer C. Blackburn #1086 responded to an abandoned vehicle at 2900 Harrison Pike. Police 
observed a light blue Chevy Monte Carlo parked on the right side of Harrison Pk. The vehicle was extremely damaged, all windows
bused, tires destroyed, and the vehicle had been stripped of all parts. After running registration on the vehicle through dispatch the 
vehicle was not found to have been reported stolen. The vehicle had been stickered with an unattended vehicle notice on 8/19/20 
at 0122 hours by officer T. Mulenga #894. Police attempted to contact the registered owner of the vehicle, Edward Bass Jr., 
however after running Mr. Bass through Coplink and contacting all listed numbers for him, all phone numbers were found to be 
disconnected. Having made multiple attempts to contact Mr. Bass and being unable to, along with the vehicle being left unattended
on a public roadway in a no parking area possibly creating a traffic hazard, the vehicle was towed from the scene by Ford's 
Wrecker. No further.

1807 E 23rd St20-085440 8/24/2020   4:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2020 at 16:50 hours, Officer Christopher Liberto (79560) reported a memo at 1807 E 23rd St. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
Ms. Princess Gray who stated that she had her cat in her vehicle repaired by Dunsons Auto. When she returned to pick up the car, 
and drove off, she noticed that another check engine light came on. Ms. Gray then took the vehicle to another repair shop and the 
shop told her that Dunsons Auto did not fix her car like they were supposed to. Dunsons Auto stated it was agreed that they were 
just going to replace the part but did not state that this would ensure that other problems would arise from working on the vehicle. 
Ms. Gray stated that she was going to get her attorney and left. Nothing further.

2000 Gunbarrel Rd20-085445 8/24/2020   8:00:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/24/2020 at 17:00 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a lost property at 2000 Gunbarrel Rd. I spoke to Antonio 
Escobar on the phone.

Mr. Escobar stated he was on Gunbarrel Rd around 0800 hours. Mr. Escobar stated around this time is when his tag fell off his 
vehicle. Mr. Escobar was unable to find it.

 
 

2330 Marco Cir20-085466 8/23/2020  10:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/24/2020 at 17:57 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a theft from vehicle at 2330 Marco Cir. I spoke to Erick 
Mathis over the phone.

Mr. Mathis stated during the night someone got into his vehicle and stole his wallet. Mr. Mathis believes he left the vehicle 
unlocked. Mr. Mathis stated his wallet contained a debit card, five credit cards, and his driver’s license. Mr. Mathis stated his debit 
card was used at the speed way on the corner of Shallowford Rd & Hickory Valley Rd around 0300 hours. Mr. Mathis has canceled 
all his cards. At this time there is no suspect info.

1522 Adams St20-085472 8/24/2020   7:03:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 20:35 hours, Officer Joshua Price (76315) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
1522 Adams St. 
While on Patrol I received an alert from my ALPR system that this vehicle was located in the area of 7020 McCutcheon Rd. I 
responded to the scene and located the vehicle at Microtel. 
Dispatch was contacted and the owner was notified.
Les Wrecker responded and towed the vehicle.

171 Baylor School Rd20-085482 8/24/2020   2:00:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/24/2020 at 18:36 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a property damage at 171  Baylor School Rd. I spoke to 
Kye Hamilton over the phone.

Mr. Hamilton stated he entered his vehicle around 1720 hours. Mr. Hamilton stated he was under the impression his back window 
was dirty, so he used the rear window wiper. Mr. Hamilton stated it was actually a crack on the rear window and once he used the 
wiper the glass completely shattered. Mr. Hamilton checked with school staff but they did not locate anything on video surveillance. 
Mr. Hamilton stated the vehicle was fine around 1400. No suspect info at this time. Mr. Hamilton is not sure whether this was 
intentional or accidental.

3619 Cherryton Dr20-085509 8/24/2020   7:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/24/2020 at 19:53 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a theft from vehicle at 3619 Cherryton Dr. I spoke to 
Carmen Joyce over the phone.

Ms. Joyce stated some time during the night, someone went in her vehicle. Ms. Joyce stated the only thing taken was a pocket 
knife and loose change. Ms. Joyce stated she might have left the window cracked open. Ms. Joyce would like a report to document
the event.

1911 E 13th St20-085521 8/24/2020   8:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/24/2020 at 20:11  hours, Officer Christopher Liberto (79560) reported a memo at 1911  E 13th St. Upon arrival, 2 anonymous 
parties stated that a verbal disorder happened in front of their house between a Mr. Thomas Springs and an unknown Black Male. 
They stated that Mr. Springs had his wife with him and the wife was threatening the Black Male. The Black Male was not on scene 
and Police were not able to locate him at this time. Nothing further.

100 N Hickory St20-085559 8/24/2020  10:55:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/24/2020 at 22:55 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) observed a gold Lincoln Towncar in the 100 block of N Hickory 
St parked with heavy front end damage.  upon running the tag ), the license plate came back to a blue 1987 
Chevrolet.  Upon running the VIN (1LNHM82W72Y611814) I found the car to be legally registered with valid registration under a 
different license plate.  The vehicle had not been reported stolen, and was parked out of the way of traffic, I left it as is and will 
check on it in the following days.

210 Sunnyside Dr20-085567 8/24/2020  11:51:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/24/2020 at 23:57 hours, Officer Calvin Cooper (#877) reported a Suspicious Person at 210 Sunnyside Dr. Upon arrival I 
checked the area for suspicious people who were by description from dispatch( carrying long guns). There was no reporting party 
to see as I drove through the area. I did not locate anyone or anything that needed police action.

6620 Bonny Oaks Dr20-085571 8/25/2020  12:15:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 00:15 hours, Officer Gross (84850) reported a assist a citizen at 6620 Bonny Oaks Dr. Police viewed a vehicle 
with its emergency lights activated on the right hand side off of the roadway of Bonny Oaks. Police viewed Tracy Pickard who was 
visibly distressed in the driver seat of her vehicle. Ms. Pickard stated that her dog (Cash) had ran away and she was searching for 
him. Ms. Pickard stated that Cash was a six year old Shih tzu, brown in color. Cash was last seen 08/24/20 in the evening time 
wearing a red dog collar. Police assisted Ms. Pickard in the search for her dog but were unsuccessful in finding Cash. Ms. Pickard 
left the scene, nothing further at this time.

5240 Fagan St20-085580 8/25/2020   1:34:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 01:37 hours, Officer Slater (84863) reported a memo at 5240 Fagan St. Upon making contact with these two 
parties I was informed that there had been a verbal argument which had taken place outside. I was informed that both parties had 
resolved the issue at hand. No further to report at this time.

1905 Gunbarrel Rd20-085597 8/25/2020   4:28:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/25/2020 at 04:35 hours, Officer Veronica Thomas (75141) responded to a Shoplifting at 1905 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival, I 
spoke to Ms. Amy Lively who stated a male party came in and stole an ice cream bar. Ms. Lively stated she was at the register 
when a male came up to another customer asking for $20. The male then walked toward the door and grabbed a ice cream bar 
and left the store. Ms. Amy then went outside telling the man he needed to pay for the item. The male party ran across Gunbarrel 
Rd toward walmart. Ms. Lively described the male to be a tall white male with dirty blond hair wearing a gray t-shirt and jeans with a
black book bag. Police searched the area but were unable to locate the male. Management will prosecute if male party is located.

8604 N Hickory Valley Rd20-085601 8/25/2020   5:17:00AM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/25/2020 at 05:25 hours, Officer Gross (84850) responded to a Theft from Building at 8604 N Hickory Valley Rd. Police 
spoke with complainant Alonzo Heyward who stated that a white male party wearing a gray shirt, blue jeans, and a baseball cap 
and a white female party wearing white shorts entered the Mapco on highway 58. 

Mr. Heyward stated that the two suspects rifled through the electronics section before approaching the counter. The male party 
asked for two cartons of cigarettes, while Mr. Heyward was retrieving the requested cigarettes he heard what sounded like ripping 
paper. When he turned around the lottery tickets dispenser had been tampered with and the male party declined the cigarettes 
before quickly exiting the store.

Mr. Heyward stated that the suspects entered a blue Mazda with the license plate of  (TN) before driving away in an 
unknown direction. License plate  does not match the vehicle description given to police. Mr. Heyward showed police a 
low quality video of the male party standing beside a vehicle matching the vehicle description. Police were unable to identify the 
license plate from the video.

Mr. Heyward stated that he did not know what items had been stolen, that his manager would be coming in the morning and would 
be able to conduct an inventory and review security cameras to provide police a better suspect and vehicle description, also a list 
of items that had been stolen.

Police searched the area but were unable to locate the suspect vehicle. Nothing further at this time.

399 Mccallie Ave20-085603 8/25/2020  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/25/2020 at 05:50 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) responded to a Vandalism at 399 Mccallie Ave. On this date, Ms. Ripley 
Mullin called dispatch asking to report a slashed tire over the phone. Ms. Mullin did not have any suspect information. When I 
contacted her she stated the rear right tire on her vehicle was slashed. Ms. Mullin was given the complaint number and given 
instructions on how to receive a copy of the Police report. Nothing further at this time.

 
 

702 E 11th St20-085625 8/25/2020   6:13:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 06:15 hours, Officer Andrew Hayes (84851) responded to an assist a citizen call at 702 E 11th St. Upon arrival, 
police spoke to the complainant, Vincent Scott, who stated that he needed a ride back home. Police attempted to contact his wife, 
Chasity Stark, but were unable to get in touch with her. Scott stated that he lived in some apartments behind the Chattanooga 
Choo Choo so police transported him there to be picked up by Stark. But due to not being able to get in touch Stark, police 
dropped him back off in front of the community kitchen where he stated he felt safest.

106 Norman Ln20-085639 8/25/2020  12:01:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/25/2020 at 08:50 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 106 Norman Ln. 

I spoke with Chelsea Nelson by telephone.  She says that she parks her 1999 Mercury on the side of the street in front of her 
residence.  She says that she had left a window partially down and an unknown party entered her vehicle.  She says that the 
unknown party stole her Adderall and a company owned Lenovo Chromebook.

 

181 Acorn Oaks Cir20-085649 8/25/2020  12:01:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 09:43 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 181  Acorn Oaks Cir. 

I spoke with Jacob Higgins by telephone.  He says that sometime during the night, an unknown party entered his 2016 Nissan 
Frontier and rummaged all through it.  He says that there was nothing stolen that he could tell.

Mr. Higgins says that he wants a record of this incident on file.

 
 

 

 



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

4610 Eldridge Rd20-085683 8/25/2020  11:32:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 11:35 hours, Officer Lorin Johnston (042491) reported a memo at 4610 Eldridge Rd. The complainant Ms Gravitt 
said her husband is at their house and she thought he could not be there. I explained he can not be there if she is present during 
his conditions of release. No further.

2828 Rossville Blvd20-085691 8/25/2020  11:45:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 11:50 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) reported a memo at 2828 Rossville Blvd. Upon arrival, I spoke with the 
complainant, Latasha Wilcutt ( ), who explained that she wanted a ride to the community kitchen. Latasha stated that 
she is homeless and wanted to get to the community kitchen, but it was a very long walk. Police offered Latasha a ride and drove 
her to the kitchen without incident. Nothing further.

1638 N Moore Rd20-085712 8/25/2020  12:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 13:00 hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 1638 N Moore Rd. Upon arrival, police spoke with 
McKinley Sims who had a question reguarding a property line dispute. Police found and answered his question and Mr. Sims was 
content.

1337 Gunbarrel Rd20-085724 8/25/2020  12:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 12:50 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) reported a memo at 1337 Gunbarrel Rd.  Police responded to a 
wellness check on Shane Hartline.  Police spoke with October Hartline who stated she was worried about Shane Hartline, her 
father.  Police spoke with Shane Hartline.  He stated everything was fine although he did use pills in the past.  Mr. Hartline was 
given the number to the Hamilton County Coalition in case he wanted to reach out for help.  Nothing further.

1113 N Hawthorne St20-085735 8/25/2020  10:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/25/2020 at 14:00 hours, Officer Sanchez (73514) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 1113 N Hawthorne St. 
Upon arrival I spoke with the complainant, Poscher Pierce ( , who explained that someone had pushed her 
mailbox over, damaging the base of the mailbox. Poscher stated that she left her house at approximately 1000hrs and returned at 
1330hrs to find that her mailbox had been damaged. She did not see who did the damage. Poscher stated that it was 
approximately $20 worth of damage. There is nothing further.

6200 Lee Hwy20-085736 8/25/2020   1:55:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/25/2020 at 13:55 hours, Officer J.Ogg (83690) initiated a traffic stop at 6200 Lee Hwy. I attempted to pull over a purple in 
color Nissan Quest. The vehicle fled from me heading towards East Brainerd. The tag displayed on the vehicle was TN . 
The tag came back on a gold Chevrolet Silverado. The vehicle was occupied by a male driver and a white female passenger. Both 
appeared to be about mid 40's in age.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

 

410 High St20-085783 8/25/2020   4:37:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/25/2020 at 16:35 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Property Lost at 410 High St. 

I spoke with Casidy Kelley by telephone.  She says that the first part of July, she had purchased a vehicle and the tag was to be 
mailed to her.  She says that the tag was to be sent to 410 High St.  She says that during the mean time, she moved to 1400 
Chestnut St.  She says that the tag never arrived at her new address nor did it arrive at the High St address.

The tag has been entered in NCIC # P127233000.

709 Whitehall Rd20-085794 8/25/2020   5:09:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/25/2020 at 17:17 hours, Officer Pierre (84860) reported a field interview at 709 Whitehall Rd. Police were dispatched to this 
location due to the report of a white SUV with all of its doors open and the gas cap was off, and it was parked on the side of the 
road. Upon arrival on scene police located the vehicle which only one rear passenger door open. Upon approaching the vehicle 
police located a female party asleep inside. This female party identified herself as Debbie Gann. Ms. Gann stated she will come 
park up here sometimes because it has a nice view. Ms. Gann stated she drove up here and was reading a devotional book, and 
praying and fell asleep in her back seat. Ms. Gann stated she did not mean to fall asleep there and would be moving along shortly.

1664 Greendale Way20-085797 8/25/2020   5:11:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/25/2020 at 17:20 hours, Officer Warren (71993) reported a memo at 1664 Greendale Way. Prior to police arrival, an 
anonymous female caller was heard to say "you're going back to jail" over the phone and disconnected. The phone number 
provided was  and the only hit on coplink was for "Mario Walker" but no other information could be obtained. Police 
searched the area but could not locate any disorder or signs of distress. No further police action could be taken.

701 Gillespie Rd20-085805 8/25/2020   5:32:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/25/2020 at 17:40 hours, Officer S. Montana (84854) responded to a Vandalism at 701  Gillespie Rd. Upon my arrival, I spoke 
with complainant Kemi Renue and victim Brandon Stanton. She stated Kymbrea Boatman came by 9AM in the morning banging on
her front door yelling. Ms. Renue stated she did not let her in or open the door and at some point she left in a Gold sedan. Later 
this evening before she called police Ms. Renue stated Ms. Boatman returned to her house and was yelling once again. She stated
she noticed the back right window of Mr. Stanton's car was busted out, but did not see who did it, but saw the same vehicle Ms. 
Boatman was driving and was able to get the tag. Ms. Renue suspected that Ms. Boatman is harassing her and damaged her Mr. 
Stanton's vehicle.

At 18:53 hours, I spoke with Ms. Boatman. She stated she did go over to her house at 9AM this morning, but to speak to Mr. 
Stanton, and did not return at 1700hrs. She stated she was getting ready to go out of town at that time. 

There is no evidence leading to convict Ms. Boatman of vandalism on Mr. Stanton's vehicle. Suspect is left unknown. Nothing 
further.

2103 Taylor St20-085828 8/25/2020   3:00:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 08/25/2020 at 15:00 hours, Officer Silveira (66499) responded to a Property Found at 2103 Taylor St.  During a recovery stolen 
vehicle at 2103 Taylor Street, I Officer Silveira #755 found a stolen Taurus G2C Serial Number 8BB279809 reported stolen from 
Bristol Department of Police under the NIC # G965011156. The weapon was reported stolen from 07/28/2020. Briston was notified 
about the recovery and the weapon was transported to Chattanooga Property Division. Two suspects were arrested for possession
of this stolen property and other charges as well under complaint number 20-087506.
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7014 Shallowford Rd20-085856 8/25/2020   5:14:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/25/2020 at 20:30 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a suspicious activity at 7014 Shallowford Rd. I spoke to 
Amber O’Gara over the phone.

Ms. O’Gara stated she is staying at the Red Roof Inn. Ms. O’Gara stated strange things have been happening. Ms. O’Gara stated 
when she went out to walk her dog there was rocks on the floor making the shape of an arrow pointing towards her door. Ms. 
O’Gara stated she is familiar with it and believes it is a satanic symbol for someone to attack her. Ms. O’Gara would like extra 
patrol and to document this incident. No suspect info at this time.

7412 Allemande Way20-085862 8/25/2020   8:54:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/25/2020 at 21:10 hours, Officer S. Montana (84854) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 7412 Allemande Way. 
Upon my arrival, I spoke with victim Rishav Shah. He stated he arrived at the location and noticed her vehicle was damaged. Mr. 
Shah stated he left multiple times and has been to many placed the last few days and just noticed the damage. There was damage
to the front right bumper. It is unknown of location of incident and what damaged his vehicle. Nothing further.

2124 Shepherd Rd20-085906 8/26/2020  12:21:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 00:25 hours, Officer Nathan Greene (68398) reported a memo at 2124 Shepherd Rd.  Police responded to an 
alarm located at the address above.  Upon canvassing the building Police observed a known homeless party identified as Larry 
Ransom sleeping behind the building.  Mr. Ransom showed a warrant out of state non-extradition.  There was no responsible to 
see nor was there any signs of forced entry.  Mr. Ransom was asked to leave and did so without incident.

2310 N Chamberlain Ave20-085924 8/26/2020   2:00:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/26/2020 at 10:47 hours, Officer Franks (68395) responded to 1907 Oak St. for a suspicious vehicle. Upon arrival I observed 
the a gray Nissan Versa (TN  which came back stolen. I then notified the owner and had the vehicle towed due to the 
damages from a crash that occurred after the vehicle was stolen. Ault Towing responded to tow the vehicle to their lot located at 
2415 E Main St. I then had the vehicle removed from NCIC. Nothing further to report at this time.

8306 Grinder Creek Pl20-085925 8/26/2020   2:43:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/26/2020 at 13:51  hours, Officer J.Ogg (83690) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 8306 
Grinder Creek Pl. 

Police located the vehicle at 200 tunnel blvd. The vehicle was pulled into a driveway at a residence at this location. I was unable to 
make contact with anyone at the residence. There was no other indication of suspect information left with the vehicle. The vehicle 
was released to the owner on scene. The vehicle had strong smell of marijuana and had a roach and lose marijuana in the floor 
boards of the vehicle. No further police action at this time.

7200 Discovery Dr20-085940 8/25/2020   6:15:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/26/2020 at 11:24 hours, Officer J. Wright (63087) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 7200 
Discovery Dr.  While working Teleserve police were put in contact with Carey Johnson via phone.  Mr. Johnson wanted to add 
another phone number to his report to help police get in contact with him if they needed to speak with him any further.  That newer 
number is:  .  

This report was taken via Teleserve.

7717 Lee Hwy20-085979 8/26/2020   9:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 09:00 hours, Officer N. Hayes (71971) reported a memo at 7717 Lee Hwy.   While collecting evidence from a 
separate case, myself and Investigator Willis observed a verbal argument happening in the parking lot.  Patrol was notified and 
they arrived on scene.  While investigating this incident, the listed Chevrolet Trailblazer was observed in the parking lot with a 
broken rear window, a punched ignition and a steering column being held together with electrical tape.  No owner could be 
contacted at this time, the vehicle was towed as suspect stolen.  We are still working to ascertain if the vehicle is actually stolen or 
not.  The report will be updated when this is discovered.

1103 Regency Ct20-086003 8/26/2020  10:49:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 08/26/2020 at 10:48 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Property Lost at 1103 Regency Ct. 

I spoke with Laquita Brown by telephone.  She says that on 25 April 2020, she purchased a 2012 Mercedes from out of state.  She 
says that the dealership mailed the license plate to her.  She says that she never received it.  She says that it has to have been los
in the mail.

The plate has been entered in NCIC # P707283462.

2705 Curtis St20-086015 8/26/2020  11:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 11:35 hours I, Officer King (78347), responded to a Disorder at 2705 Curtis St.  Upon arrival I spoke to the 
complainant, Ms. Cassandra Lawler.  MS. Lawler stated that she is getting evicted fro from the house she was renting and that she
has a court order to get her belongings out of the house and yard before Sunday the 30th.  She stated that there was a court order 
stating that the landlord was not supposed to be having work done on the house until she is out but there was a construction crew 
there working on the roof.  Ms. Lawler did not have a copy of a court order to show Police.  She also stated that she had a court 
order stating that she is allowed to take the chain the link fence down and take it with her when she leaves.  I told her that she 
needed to show me the court order or I could not let her take it and she said that she was leaving to go to the courthouse to try and
get an order saying that she can take the fence.  I told her to cal back if she got the order and she was allowed to take it.  '

I also spoke to the landlord, Mr. Johnny Parker.  Mr. Parker stated that Ms. Lawler has received multiple extensions from the court 
to get her belongings out the house and that he is trying to fix house in order to rent it.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

 
 

 

  
.

 

3008 Alton Park Blvd20-086114 8/26/2020   5:09:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/29/2020 at 14:16 hours, Officer Michael S Smith (60674) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
3008 Alton Park Blvd.  This stolen vehicle was found by Cleveland PD at the Hampton Inn on Frontage Street.  It is unknown if 
Cleveland PD had it towed or if the owner picked it up.  Dispatch had the vehicle removed from NCIC.  No further information is 
available at this time.

200 Browns Ferry Rd20-086121 8/26/2020   4:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/26/2020 at 16:31  hours, Officer Padlo (79534) reported a memo at 200 Browns Ferry Rd. Police responded to a back other 
agency on I-24 WB. Catoosa County Sheriff Deputy notified dispatch stating they were behind a vehicle with a stolen tag. Police 
caught up to the vehicle at 200 Browns Ferry Road and initiated a traffic stop. The driver was identified as Timothy Pierce. Mr. 
Pierce stated the tag should not be stolen because its a company truck. After running the tag on info channel, the tag did not come 
back stolen. However it did come back to a different truck. Police ran the VIN of the truck and it was not stolen. The conclusion that
police came up with is that the tag was switched out by an unknown person. Mr. Pierce was let go with a warning.

637 W 14th Street Ct20-086128 8/26/2020   5:24:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/26/2020 at 17:25 hours, Officer Zachary Lloyd (79530) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 637 W 14th Street 
Ct. Upon arrival, police made contact with the victim, Antoine Taylor. Antoine said he was told that the rear window of his vehicle 
had been busted out. Antoine said that everything was still in the vehicle and nothing appeared to be stolen. At this time there is no
information on who or how the damage occurred.

1200 Carter St20-086130 8/26/2020   5:17:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 17:17 hours, Officer Zachary Lloyd (79530) reported a memo at 1200 Carter St. While patrolling in the area, I 
was alerted by a anonymous citizen that there was some type of disorder in the vicinity of the above location. I made contact with 
Drekell House and Kiesha Wilson in the area. Neither party wanted to speak with me or give me any information on what 
happened. Eventually, both parties said they had a verbal disorder and did not need police.

3099 E Main St20-086138 8/26/2020   5:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/26/2020 at 17:00 hours, Inv. Morgan attempted to Starchase a black Nissan Altima with a Maine tag at E Main and S 
Seminole. The dart struck the ground directly in front of the Police vehicle and did not stick to the suspect vehicle. The dart was 
recovered and vehicle BOLO'd. No further.

5839 Brainerd Rd20-086154 8/26/2020   6:05:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/26/2020 at 18:30 hours, Officer S. Montana (84854) responded to a Theft from Building at 5839 Brainerd Rd. Upon my 
arrival, I spoke with Logistics Manager, Katherine Whaley. She stated this white male came and stole a generator.  Ms. Whaley 
stated he was only in the store for about 3 minutes and ran out with the item. He drives a Gray Honda Civic 2DR. This unknown 
suspect also came in the day before and stole another item the same exact way.  No further at this time.

3401 Cummings Hwy20-086183 8/26/2020   7:10:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/26/2020 at 19:10 hours, Officer J. Waltero (79887) responded to a deceptive practice call over the phone and I spoke to a 
Ronny Mansfield.

Mr. Mansfield stated he was scammed $25 dollars from a female he met over the internet. Mr. Mansfield stated the female claims 
to live in Chattanooga. Mr. Mansfield stated he has been scammed twice by the female. Mr. Mansfield would like us to be aware of 
this in case anyone else is scammed. Mr. Mansfield was all over the place with the information and none of it was accurate. At this 
time this is all we have. Mr. Mansfield does not live in Chattanooga.

800 Mccallie Ave20-086189 8/26/2020   7:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 19:55 hours, Officer D. Bryant (79858) reported a memo at 800 Mccallie Ave.  Police received a phone call 
stated William Crew was in a disorder with seven people. Upon arrival police made contact with Crew who stated he was not in a 
disorder and he was just fine. Police observed Crew to be just fine and he did not appear as if he had been in a disorder. No 
further.

1175 Pineville Rd20-086199 8/26/2020  12:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 09:36 hours, Officer Thomas (78350) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1175 
Pineville Rd. Police located the stolen auto at 3251  Rossville Blvd. The vehicle was towed by united wrecker at 3810 Rossville 
Blvd. Vehicle was removed from ncic as stolen. Nothing further.

 
 
 

7310 Standifer Gap Rd20-086231 8/26/2020   9:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/26/2020 at 22:30 hours, Officer J.Vasquez (79542) responded to a Vandalism at 7310 Standifer Gap Rd. Spoke to Mr. Ryan 
Christa by phone who stated he came out of his apartment to discover that his driver side door of his 2003 Hummer HII was open. 
Upon checking the vehicle he noticed the driver side door panel was damaged, and the vehicle has been ransacked. Mr. Christa 
said his speakers were taken out and thrown in the floor; However they are not damage. Mr. Christa said he believes he locked his
car. Mr. Christa said he observed 2 black males wearing all black standing by the dumpsters of the above location. Nothing further.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

1114 N Hawthorne St20-086247 8/26/2020  10:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 23:00 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) responded to an animal call at 1114 N Hawthorne St. Upon 
arrival, I spoke with Ms. Mason, who stated that she had another opossum in her house.  Several days prior I had removed a 
young opossum from her bathroom and placed it outside.  Ms. Mason stated she had other officers also remove one from her 
house as well.  Ms. Mason stated that her landlord had animal control come out and set traps, but did not know if anything had 
been caught.  I helped Ms Mason secure her attic and searched her son's room, but I was unable to locate any animals.  Ms. 
Mason asked for a police report to help her with documentation for her landlord.  No further.

3820 Dorris St20-086252 8/26/2020  11:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/26/2020 at 23:15 hours, Officer Wiegand (84865) was dispatched to a disorder at 3820 Dorris St. Upon arrival police spoke 
with the resident Dandre Leonard who stated his ex girlfriend Nickquisha Roberson had been staying with him at this address and 
that she now refused to leave. Mr. Leonard also stated Ms. Roberson lived with him for a while before leaving and 3 days ago he 
let her back in because she had nowhere else to go. Prior to police arrival Mr. Leonard stated he was in a verbal altercation with 
Ms. Roberson. Police spoke with Ms. Roberson who stated she was trying to leave but Mr. Leonard refused to return her phone. 
Police observed Ms. Roberson with her phone upon arrival. Ms. Roberson stated she was waiting for her mother to come pick up 
her and her belongings. Police assisted with loading up the belongings and Ms. Roberson left the scene. Nothing further at this 
time.

3512 Idlewild Cir20-086268 8/27/2020   1:05:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 01:20 hours, Officer K. Allen (123) reported for a memo well being check at 3512 Idlewild Cir. I was informed by 
dispatch that the complainant/mom, Ms. Kate San Miguel, has not been able to make phone contact with her son, Mr. Alan San 
Miguel, for approximately one day. I arrived at Mr. Miguel's home at 3512 Idlewild Cir where I located his burgundy Kia and gray 
Honda (TN,  in his drive way. I approached the front door and noticed that it was ajar. I pushed the door open a little 
further and announced my presence as a police officer several times with no reply. I continued to call out and identify myself as a 
police officer while waiting for more units. Once additional officers arrived we made entry into the home continuing to make out 
presence known. We finally made contact with a tenant, Mr. Stanley Nelson, who stated that he saw Mr. Miguel walking his dog at 
approximately 1700 hours on 8/26/2020. We located Mr. Miguel's room a short time later with the door locked. His dog could be 
heard barking when officers knocked on the door. Contact was not made with Mr. Miguel however Mr. Nelson said he will remind 
him to call his mother when he wakes up. Mr. Nelson was made aware of the unsecured door and made changes to the lock as 
needed. I called Ms. Miguel and informed her of my findings. She stated that she would call him again in the morning. No further 
police action was taken at this time.

4355 Hwy 5820-086273 8/27/2020   2:10:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/27/2020 at 02:25 hours, Officer Harvey,Charles (66485) responded to a Shoplifting at 4355 Hwy 58.   On scene police 
spoke to Ms. Wynn who is the night clerk at the Speedway at the above address and she stated that an unknown black female 
came into the store and put several bags of candy valued at $20.00 dollars in her purse and then left the store without paying for 
the candy.  BWC was worn and activated during this call for service.

3601 Calhoun Ave20-086286 8/27/2020   4:50:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 05:10 hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 3601  Calhoun Ave. for a report of suspicious activity.  
Upon arrival, officers spoke to Christina Menair, who stated that she noticed a blue GMC Jimmy parked down the road at 3601  
Calhoun Ave.(Moonlight Rollers).  She stated she noticed a male and female carrying items from the business, her and her sister 
went to see what was going on but the vehicle and suspects left the area.  Officers checked the business but everything was 
secure.  Officers attempted to locate a responsible to check everything was fine with the business.  A responsible could not be 
located at the time.  No further.

2341 Mccallie Ave20-086312 8/27/2020   7:53:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/27/2020 at 07:53 hours, Officer R. Ballard (60157) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 2341  Mccallie Ave. 
Upon arrival, I spoke with Frank Nicholson. Mr. Nicholson reported he was told by co-workers that his vehicle was on fire. Mr. 
Nicholson reported he parked his vehicle in the employee parking lot as he do every morning and went in to work. Mr. Nicholson 
stated he did not notice anything suspicious about his vehicle as he was driving to work. The Chattanooga Fire Department 
responded and extinguish the fire from Mr. Nicholson's vehicle. No further police assistance was needed.

312 Mcbrien Rd20-086314 8/27/2020   8:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 08:00 hours, Officer Branam (70776) reported a memo at 312 Mcbrien Rd.  The caller, Kayla Springer, stated 
that she needed to retrieve items from her previous residence.  She was able to do so without incident.

2604 Standifer Chase Dr20-086315 8/27/2020   8:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 08:05 hours, Officer M Pollard (63828) reported a memo at 2604 Standifer Chase Dr. 

Upon my arrival, I spoke with Mr. John Domanski. He stated that on August 26, 2020, at approximately 0401  hours, three white 
males arrived in their area. One suspect had stolen a neighbors bicycle (2602 Standifer Chase Drive). A report was made for the 
theft. The other two were checking car door handles, attempting to get in and steal items. One suspect opened up Mr. Domanski's 
vehicle and rummaged through, but did not take anything. From the video footage that I was shown, all three suspects are white 
males. At this time there are no other leads, witnesses, or suspect information.

4833 Preserve Dr20-086324 8/27/2020   4:02:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 12:10 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 4833 
Preserve Dr. 

I spoke with Karen Carter.  She says that her video camera recorded the following.  A white Toyota with TN tag .  One male 
got out went to her truck tried to get in.  It was locked.  She also stated that two other male parties got out and went to cars across 
the street from her residence and checked the doors on vehicles there.  She says that she does not believe they gained entry to 
those vehicles.

Nothing further.

91 S Crest Rd20-086329 8/27/2020   8:40:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 08/27/2020 at 09:15 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a Property Found at 91  S Crest Rd. Upon arrival police spoke 
to Ted Wilkes who stated that a tire inflater in a black bag and a set of jumper cables in a back bag were found near the rear of his 
driveway. It is unknown who the property belongs to at this time. Items taken to CPD property.

7310 Standifer Gap Rd20-086339 8/27/2020  12:01:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 09:01  hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 7310 Standifer Gap Rd. 

I spoke with Ms. Clay by telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party broke into her Hyundai Accent 
and ransacked the inside.  She says that the did not find any damage to the vehicle and does not know how entry was made. She 
says that there was nothing of value in the vehicle and nothing was stolen.

800 Market St20-086354 8/27/2020   9:45:00AM 91Z Field Interview



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/27/2020 at 09:45 hours, Officer J kirk (60829) reported a memo at 800 Market St. using case# 20-86354.  Police stopped 
with two white males setting at the bus stop with open beers next to them.  I asked for the owner of the beer to pour them out.  
David Sanderson was cooperative, got up and poured out the beer and threw the can away without being asked.  The other beer 
set there without an owner in the area of Scott Forman.  I asked him to pour it out but he said that it was not his and he did not 
want to touch it.  I poured the beer out and asked him to throw the can away as he passes the trash can.  Both parties were able to
get up and walk without trouble as they left the area.  No other actions were needed at this time.

2106 Union Ave20-086361 8/27/2020  12:01:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 10:13 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 2106 Union Ave. 

I spoke with Courtney Washington by telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party "popped the lock" on 
her 2007 Nissan pathfinder and ransacked the inside of her vehicle.  She says there was no damage to the vehicle. 

She says that she does not keep anything of value in her vehicle and nothing was taken.

243 Roxbury Cir20-086365 8/27/2020  10:40:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 10:20 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 243 Roxbury Cir. Upon arrival to 
the scene I located the complainant named Lakeisha Powell. Ms. Powell informed me that she owned a firearm that was recently 
purchased. The firearm was placed into one of her vehicles due to not having a safe for it inside of her home. Ms. Powell stated 
that she didn't want the kids to get a hold of it and could lock it inside of the cars glove box. Unfortunately, she discovered that the 
car was broken into and the firearm was stolen. No suspect information at this time.

The firearm was placed into NCIC as stolen under NIC/G995112389

2479 Bridge Cir20-086368 8/25/2020  11:00:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/27/2020 at 10:19 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) responded to a Theft from Building at 2479 Bridge Cir. 

I spoke with Erica Henderson by telephone.  She says that Tuesday 25 August 2020, she received an iPhone in the mail.  She 
says that she took the SIM card out of her old phone and placed it in the box with the new iPhone.  She says that night, an 
unknown party broke into her apartment and stole the SIM card but left the iPhone.

She says that there are scuff marks on the floor and scratches on the inside of the door.  She says that the locks were tampered 
with.  I asked if they were tampered with from outside.  She says that she does not know because she is quarantined and will not 
open her door
.

3901 Hixson Pike20-086383 8/27/2020  11:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 11:05 hours, Officer C. Glenn (60757) reported a memo at 3901  Hixson Pike. 

I spoke with Christi Staggs, a Dollar Tree employee. by telephone.  She says that about 1100, the back door alarm went off.  She 
says by the time she got back there the door was closed and she opened it and saw a truck driving off.  She says there is no 
security camera in the back room.  She says that she does not know if anything was stolen or not.

Nothing further.

2518 Lucie Ct20-086395 8/27/2020  12:03:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/27/2020 at 12:15 hours, Officer M Pollard (63828) reported a memo at 2518 Lucie Ct. 

Upon my arrival, I spoke with Ms. Craig. She stated that approximately 0245 hours, an unknown person approached her home. 
The person tried the storm door to see if it was unlocked. The suspect did not attempt to do anything else. Ms. Craig agreed to 
have her home placed on the watch list for the next 30 days.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

3535 Brainerd Rd20-086399 8/27/2020  12:12:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 12:12 hours, Officer R. Ballard (60157) reported a memo at 3535 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
Christine McNair. Ms. McNair reported she got into a verbal argument with her daughter's boyfriend, David Tarpley. Police spoke 
with Mr. Tarpley who stated the same. Both parties left the area without any incident.

2053 Cannondale Loop20-086403 8/26/2020   9:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 12:45 hours, Officer Kilpatrick (68405) responded to an MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 2053 Cannondale Loop. Ms. 
Barajas reported that between 08/26/20 at 2100hrs and 08/27/20 at about 1100hrs, an unknown suspect took her vehicle from the 
driveway of her home. She stated that the key had been left in the car. No investigative leads were available at that time. The 
vehicle was entered into NCIC (NIC#: V482252256). Nothing further.

 
 
 
 

1513 Vance Ave20-086444 8/27/2020   2:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 14:05 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1513 Vance Ave. Upon arrival 
police spoke to Victor Williams and his wife who stated that his wife had observed two black males (approx age 50) stealing wire 
($150) from his Ford van parked in the rear of his house he uses for storage. Mr. Williams the broken window was valued at 
approx. $300. Police checked the area and could not locate the suspect's maroon sedan.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd20-086455 8/26/2020   6:30:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/27/2020 at 14:25 hours, Officer Moser (60250) responded to a Vandalism on the parking lot of Walmart located at 2020 
Gunbarrel Rd. I spoke to the victim, John McKenzie who stated on Wednesday 08/26/20 around 1830 hrs he parked his 2019 
Range Rover vehicle on the parking lot of Walmart and entered the business. 

Mr. McKenzie stated when he came back to his vehicle he found that a shopping cart was pushed up next to his vehicle so he 
moved the cart and left the area.

Mr. McKenzie stated he did not notice until later that his vehicle that the word "Bitch" was scratched into the passenger side of his 
vehicle along with some other scratch marks.

Mr. McKenzie wanted to file a report about the damage and Police will attempt to review security footage to see if a suspect can be
observed damaging his vehicle.

After speaking to LP at Walmart they attempted to review security footage but were unable to see Mr. McKenzie's vehicle or who 
damaged his vehicle.

5501 Brainerd Rd20-086456 8/27/2020   2:31:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/27/2020 at 14:31  hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) reported a disorder at CVS, located at 5501  Brainerd Rd.  Upon arrival, I 
spoke with Iris Middlebrook who informed me a tall white male yelled a racial slur at her while he was inside the business.  Ms. 
Middlebrook aksed to find the man and ban him from the business, but I could not locate him after canvassing the area.

2300 Windsor St20-086466 8/27/2020   3:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 15:00 hours, Officer R. Ballard (60157) reported a memo at 2300 Windsor St.  I spoke with Kalesha Gibbs via 
phone. Ms. Gibbs wanted to document suspicious activity that occurred on 8/21/20 around 1100hrs. Ms. Gibbs reported while she 
was at a gas station in the Brainerd area, a white SUV pulled alongside her vehicle. Ms. Gibbs stated the vehicle was occupied by 
a well-dressed b/m. Ms. Gibbs reported the man was smiling at her young daughter who was inside the vehicle. Ms. Gibbs 
reported she drove off and the man followed her for several blocks before turning onto another street. Ms. Gibbs reported that 
later, her daughter told her she saw the same man near their apartment complex driving around. Ms. Gibbs reported she will notify 
the police if she sees him again.

8098 Ferdinand Piech Way20-086481 8/27/2020  12:00:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/28/2020 at 07:44 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Building at 8098 Ferdinand Piech Way at 
Harrison Elementary school, which is currently a construction site. The complainant is an employee with DD Piping and he has 
been working there. He said he last saw his impact wrench sitting on a work cart inside the building yesterday. He then went 
outside for lunch around 12:00 noon and when he returned around 12:30, he discovered that it was gone. He said that he has no 
idea who took it and there were other workers on the job site at the time. This report was taken by phone.

2401 Fairleigh St20-086492 8/27/2020   4:54:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/28/2020 at approximately 16:03 hours, I Officer Virden #691, acting in the capacity of CPD Teleserve 10, added a 
supplement to this Motor Vehicle Theft report. The victim called to add VIN #C58N172744 to the report for his stolen 1958 
Chevrolet Biscayne. The vehicle was entered into NCIC as stolen under NIC #V202281599. No further.

4625 Hancock Rd20-086555 8/27/2020   7:53:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 20:00 hours, Officer Kieran Daly (84844) responded to a disorder at 4625 Hancock Rd. Upon arrival I met with 
the complainant, Mr. Jimmy Hall, who stated he was concerned that rocks from lawn work that Mr. Herman Carter was doing, were 
going to hit his cars. When talking with Mr. Hall, he stated he does not believe it to be on purpose, but would just like for me to talk 
to Mr. Carter. When talking with Mr. Carter, he stated that he has previous talked with Mr. Hall before and is currently actively 
trying not to cause any rocks to hit the cars when he is Weed eating. No further action was needed.

6571 Esquire Ln20-086559 8/27/2020   7:13:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/31/2020 at 19:36 hours, Officer Gouger (82263) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 6571  
Esquire Ln. Vehicle was removed from NCIC due to owner having vehicle back.

1117 E 3rd St20-086568 8/27/2020   7:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 19:40 hours, Officer D. Bryant (79858) reported a memo at 1117 E 3rd St. Police received several calls from the 
above location about a disorder. Upon arrival police made contact with employees at McDonalds who stated Brittany Seeley 
became upset when she was told she needed a mask. Seeley became upset and started a verbal argument with McDonalds staff. 
Seeley was asked to leave in which she agreed. No further.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

 
 

 
 

2207 Overnite Dr20-086576 8/27/2020   7:50:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 08/27/2020 at 19:55 hours, Officer N. Shelor (78349) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 2207 
Overnite Dr. Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Nacheli Martinez; she stated a customer walked into the restaurant and sat at the bar. 
She said that he ordered 5 drinks and then got up and walked out of the store. He was stopped by another employee and asked if 
he paid for his drinks and he told them, he did not have any money to pay for them. He then proceeded to walk out of the 
restaurant and towards Shallowford Rd. 
The manager then walked out of the store, following him, and asked him to come back to pay for his drinks. He again told her that 
he did not have any money and was not coming back. She attempted to get his name, but he refused and left the area.
Ms. Martinez stated she did not want to press charges against the male just wanted to make a report about the incident. 
I searched the area and was unable to locate anyone matching the description she gave me. No further.

2106 Camden St20-086582 8/27/2020   8:22:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/27/2020 at 20:27 hours, Officer Michael Ortiz (83692) reported a memo at 2106 Camden St. An anonymous caller stated 
that a heavy set black male, with a blue shirt was trying to open the front door of the church at 2106 Camden St. Police located this
male across the street from the church. This male was identified as Demetrius Benn. Mr. Benn stated that he was just sitting on 
the church steps and was not trying to open any doors. Mr. Benn was told to leave the church property. Nothing further.

501 N Highland Park Ave20-086595 8/27/2020   8:56:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/27/2020 at 20:56 hours, Officer Pearson, M (84858) reported a memo at 501  N Highland Park Avenue. During routine patrol 
police found vehicle #1 Toyota Yaris parked on the side o the road in the loading zone of the school at this location. Police checked 
the vehicle and found it to be unoccupied. Police found no signs of illegal activity in plain view in the vehicle. Police will return to the
location during business hours in order to see if the vehicle belongs to staff before taking any action or "stickering" the vehicle with 
an abandoned vehicle sticker.

5009 Club Dr20-086603 8/27/2020   9:30:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/27/2020 at 21:36 hours, Officer J. Fincher (84846) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 5009 Club Dr. Police made 
contact with victim Sales Natividad who stated her vehicle has been stolen. Ms. Natividad stated the she is uncertain when the 
vehicle was taken. Ms. Natividad said she saw the vehicle park in front of her house around 2000 hours on this date and then the 
vehicle fled. Ms. Natividad was not able to get any suspect information. Police entered the vehicle into NCIC as stolen (NIC 
#V512268747). No further.

1185 Mountain Creek Rd20-086640 8/27/2020  11:51:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 08/29/2020 at 04:46 hours, Officer William, Curvin (61435) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
1185 Mountain Creek Rd. The stolen vehicle was recovered in East Ridge by East Ridge police. The vehicle was taken ouyt of 
NCIC.

2153 Camden St20-086643 8/27/2020  11:43:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/27/2020 at 23:45 hours, Officer M. Dagostino (82257) responded to a disorder at 2153 Camden St. Ms. Boyd informed me 
her roommate's mother was staying with them who is not a resident and was causing a disorder and wanted her to leave. I spoke 
with Ms. Carter who was being argumentative with Ms. Boyd and was very emotional but agreed to leave. Ms. Carter gathered her 
belongings and left without incident. This call was closed with no further police action needed. Nothing further to report.

1092 Combs Trl20-086669 8/28/2020   2:19:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 02:25 hours, Officer William, Curvin (61435) reported a memo at 1092 Combs Trl. Police responded to the 1092 
Combs Trl. for a 911  call with open line. On arrival I talked to Elizabeth Bledsoe and several other people. I did not locate any 
disorders.

3915 Volunteer Dr20-086680 8/28/2020   4:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 04:10 hours, Officer Harvey,Charles (66485) reported a memo at 3915 Volunteer Dr.  On scene police spoke to 
Mr. Hunter who is the night manager at the above location and he stated he had an employee leave while on the clock and that he 
had tested positive for alcohol. Mr. Hunter stated he just needed a report for work purposes.  Mr. Hunter stated the employee's 
name was Derrick Ross. BWC was worn and activated during this call for service.

3810 Rossville Blvd20-086682 8/28/2020   3:29:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/28/2020 at 04:29 hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 3810 Rossville Blvd. (United Transport) for a report of a 
theft. Upon arrival, officers spoke to Mr. Curtis Wilson the owner of the business, who stated that around 0325 hours a Blue Ford 
F-150 pulled up to their back alley. The truck then hooked a chain to the gate and pulled the gate open breaking it. The suspects 
in the truck a white male and female went into the tow yard and went through a White Lincoln Corsair with dealer tags. Mr. Wilson 
stated that the vehicle was involved in an accident on 07/26/2020 (20-074194). Officers were then informed that the vehicle was 
being held as a crime scene. The same report number states that the vehicle was being held for Kentucky police for being a part 
of a string of auto thefts. Mr. Wilson is unsure what was taken from the vehicle but knows that the vehicle has been gone through. 
The vehicle had multiple items on the ground around it that wasn't there before. Mr. Wilson was given the complaint number for 
the damage done to his gate. The suspects and vehicle were all recorded on the business's camera system. No further at this 
time.

1512 S Holtzclaw Ave20-086690 8/28/2020   5:17:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 05:21  hours, Officer M. Recaido #965 was dispatched to 1512 S Holtzclaw Ave. for a disorder.  Upon arrival, 
officers met with Mr. Danny Furgason who stated that an unknown black male threatened to beat him up.  The black male was not 
on scene when police arrived.  Mr. Furgason just wanted the incident recorded.

1121 E 14th St20-086701 8/28/2020   2:30:00AM 290 Vandalism



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/28/2020 at 06:45 hours, Officer Ayres (82234) responded to a Vandalism at 1121  E 14th St.  Upon arrival I spoke with Alex 
Mvuyekure.  Mr. Mvuyekure stated he drives a sliver Mazda Van (TN Reg: ), which is owned by his sister, Agnez Kigeme.  
Mr. Mvuyekure stated he last parked the vehicle in front of his residence at the above address at approximately 0200 hrs., where 
he last knew the vehicle to be undamaged.  Mr. Mvuyekure stated he came out to his vehicle at approximately 0630 hrs. and found 
both driver side tires and the windshield of the vehicle to be damaged.  I observed both tires of the vehicle to be flat and appeared 
to have been pierced with a sharp object, and the windshield to be shattered near the driver side of the vehicle.  Mr. Mvuyekure 
stated he did not have any suspect information regarding the damage to the vehicle.  

Ms. Kigeme did respond on scene to confirm that she is the owner of the vehicle and the damage observed is new damage to the 
vehicle.  Ms. Kigeme estimated the damage of the vehicle to be $900.  Ms. Kigeme would like to prosecute police were able to 
determine a suspect for this incident.

There are no cameras at the residence and there is no information available to determine a suspect for this incident at this time.

No further action was taken for this incident.

3117 Alton Park Blvd20-086707 8/28/2020   7:29:00AM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 08/28/2020 at 07:29 hours, Officer Eric Lee Milchak, Sr. (0060836) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 3117 Alton Park Blvd. United Recovery.

Police located a vehicle that was reported stolen NIC#VOO2253781  blue 2019 Chevy Sliverado  bearing AL tag  and 
VIN# 1GC1KTEY3KF184008. Thje vehicle was reported stolen out of Scottsboro Alabama. The vehicle was removed from NCIC 
on 08/28/2020 by Scottsboro Alabama Police Department. The vehicle was reposesed by United Recovery.

7010 Mccutcheon Rd20-086716 8/28/2020   7:57:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/28/2020 at 08:05 hours, Officer M Pollard (63828) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 7010 Mccutcheon Rd. 

Upon my arrival I spoke with the complainant, Mr. Jesus Alberto Depablos Sanchez. He stated that sometime in the middle of the 
night someone had broken into his vehicle. The suspect did not take any of his work items or items of value. The suspect only took 
his identity documents. However, the suspect may have left a cell phone or place a stolen cell phone inside the victims vehicle. 
The Iphone was taken into the property room. I also notified Auto Crimes about the incident.

1747 Oakvale Dr20-086747 8/27/2020  10:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/28/2020 at 09:35 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1747 Oakvale Dr at the victim's 
home. The victim said that he left his vehicle parked at home overnight from about 10 pm last night to about 6 am this morning and 
it was left unlocked with his gun (pistol) in the console. When he got back to the vehicle, he discovered that the gun was gone 
along with about $20 or $30 worth of change and the inside had been rummaged through. This report was taken by phone.    The 
gun was entered into NCIC under Nic# G865095602.   Vehicle Info: 2019 Chevy 3500 Silverado pkup

2315 Kirby Ave20-086771 8/23/2020   9:00:00PM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 08/28/2020 at 11:40 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 2315 Kirby Ave. Upon arrival police 
spoke to Paul Mikel, who stated that he had posted a green Hysung scooter for sale on Letgo for $400. Mr. Mikel stated that a 
"Erik Works" w/m approx age 18-25 contacted him and met at his house on 8/23/2020 around 2100 hours to purchase the scooter. 
Mr. Mikel told police that he realized the suspect had given him  six "Prop copy" $50 bills when he attempted to pay a bill with it and
looked at them closer. The vin number to the scooter is L5YACBPD0K116441  which is not on file. The scooter is not reported 
stolen due to the circumstances involving the sale. The "prop copy" bills were taken to CPD property.

4200 Bonny Oaks Dr20-086774 8/28/2020  11:26:00AM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/28/2020 at 11:26 hours, Officer M Pollard (63828) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 
4200 Bonny Oaks Dr. 

While patrolling the area, I located a vehicle which appeared to be broken down. I checked the vehicle and the windows were 
down. The registration tag came back as a Ford Mustang. The vehicle is a Ford Focus. I ran the VIN and discovered that the 
vehicle was stolen. The VIN #1FAFP36312W135230. I notified police dispatch and confirmed the vehicle was stolen. The NIC 
#V912224751. NIC # was removed from NCIC once the vehicle was hooked up by the tow company. Les' Wrecker arrived to tow 
vehicle away.

5515 Brainerd Rd20-086783 8/28/2020  11:50:00AM 250 Counterfeiting/Forgery

On 08/28/2020 at 12:20 hours, Officer Kilpatrick (68405) responded to a Counterfeiting/Forgery at 5515 Brainerd Rd (Regions 
Bank). Mr. Griffin (employee) reported that Ms. Suttles and an unknown white male came into the bank, at which time Ms. Suttles 
presented a Regions personal check that appeared to be from the account of, and be written out by Ms. Adcock for $962, to be 
cashed. The bank staff found this suspicious and attempted to stall the couple while police were contacted, but the two left in a 
silver SUV before police arrived. Mr. Griffin stated that the check was turned over to their fraud unit and he provided a copy of the 
check and Ms. Suttles' TN DL. FTO Kilpatrick then spoke with Ms. Adcock, who stated that she still had the actual check with the 
check number presented by Ms. Suttles. The forged check was retained by Regions fraud unit. Ms. Adcock verified that the 
signature on the counterfeit check looked like hers, but was not. Neither the bank nor Ms. Adcock were at a loss of funds. Nothing 
further.

 

2302 Wilcox Blvd20-086813 8/28/2020   1:05:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/28/2020 at 13:20 hours, Officer Mayweather (61094) reported a memo at 2302 Wilcox Blvd. Upon arrival at the New Enon 
Baptist Church I made contact with a homeless party, Mr. Maurice Essie walking away from the property. Mr. Essie is from 
Knoxville, Tn. He has no warrants. No further action taken.

4314 Rossville Blvd20-086848 8/28/2020   2:43:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 09/01/2020 at 14:25 hours, Officer William Tallant Jr (61913) wrote a continuation/supplement for an MVT/Passenger Vehicle 
at 4314 Rossville Blvd. Police were dispatched to the 4000 block of 7th Av. on an abandoned auto. Upon arrival, police located a 
2002 Nissan Pathfinder w/o a tag. Police confirmed the vehicle as stolen, NIC #V862270378. The victim, Red's Auto Sales, was 
notified and responded to the scene. The vehicle was released back to the victim/owner. The vehicle was removed from NCIC. 
The vehicle was found unoccupied.

 

3410 7th Ave20-086864 8/27/2020   8:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/28/2020 at 15:18 hours, Officer Michael S Smith (60674) spoke with a translator for Agler Vasquez via phone regarding a 
Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 3410 7th Ave.  Mr. Vasquez relayed that sometime during the night someone stole the license
plate (TN TAG ) off of his 2015 Nissan Sentra.  I had the license plate entered into NCIC under NIC # P117237617.  No 
suspect information is known.  Nothing further to report at this time.

2104 Mccallie Ave20-086867 8/28/2020   3:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 16:10 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded at 2104 Mccallie Ave (Walgreens). and spoke to a store employee 
regarding a FedEx package that was delivered to their location. The employee stated that Aaliyah Sivels ordered a package # 
907317195613 that was delivered to this location. Ms. Sivels took the package and refused to sign for it.

1507 Hickory Valley Rd20-086869 8/28/2020  11:41:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 15:45 hours, Officer Dropp (675) reported a memo at 1507 Hickory Valley Rd. Officers made contact with Hunter 
Schrah, who stated that he was concerned that the motorcycle he bought from a friend was reported stolen. He stated that his 
friend currently has his car, because when he bought the motorcycle he did not have a down payment to give him. Mr. Schrah 
stated that his friend wanted more money for the motorcycle than what they agreed upon, and stated that since he refused to give 
more money, the friend threatened to report the motorcycle stolen. Officers verified in NCIC that the motorcycle was not reported 
stolen. Nothing further to report at this time.

 

6882 Spence Ln20-086917 8/28/2020   5:53:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 17:55 hours, Officer N. Shelor (78349) responded to a Disorder at 6882 Spence Ln. Upon arrival, I walked up to 
the room and did not hear any kind of commotion yelling or screaming coming from the apartment. Ms. Teaira Byers met me at the 
door and I followed her inside. Once inside the apartment, I found Mr. Karon Gaines on the telephone. 
Ms. Byers stated that they got into an argument because Mr. Gaines yelled at her 7 year old son and she did not like it. When 
speaking with Mr. Gaines he stated that he did yell at her son because he was being disrespectful and he did not like it. Mr. Gaines
called for a ride and walked away from the residence. At this time, there did not appear to be any kind of physical altercation and al
parties were allowed to go their separate ways. No further.

 
 

.

 
 

 



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

 

 
 

 

 

1628 Starboard Dr20-087002 8/28/2020   9:54:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 8-28-20 around 21:54 hours I Ofc. Allison #237 was dispatched to contact a complainant with a phone call at 1628 Starboard 
Dr. I contacted the complainant Veda Bucher. Ms. Bucher stated that she was on a dating website and had sent a copy of her 
drivers license to an unknown man. Ms. Bucher felt like she had been scammed and wanted to make a report. Ms. Bucher did not 
have any further information. Nothing further.

4715 Tomahawk Trl20-087007 8/28/2020  10:21:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 22:50 hours, Officer K. Allen (123) reported a memo at 4715 Tomahawk Trl. I arrived on scene and spoke with 
the complainant/father, Mr. Andres Garcia, who stated that he allowed his daughter, Ms. Alondra Garcia Cano, to borrow his car as
transport for work. He called her after she got off from work and was led to believe she was on the way home. He tracked the car 
to 4715 Tomahawk Trl and found it parked in the driveway. Mr. Garcie tried calling Ms. Garcia several times with no answer and 
became worried the vehicle was stolen. I knocked on the door and made contact with Ms. Garcia who stated that she lied about 
coming straight home from work. Instead she went to her boyfriend's house. Ms. Garcie returned the keys to her father without 
issue. Mr. Garcia left the area in the car and Ms. Garcia stayed at the house with her boyfriend. No further police action was taken 
at this time.

500 W Mlk20-087013 8/28/2020  10:43:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/28/2020 at 22:58 hours, Officer Lupo (63868) was dispatched for well being check at 500 W MLK Apt 810. Olivia had called 
in worried Mr Pena might have passed. Upon arrival for well being check on Reynaldo Pena police had Q1 Chattanooga Fire 
Department help open the door with a master key. Mr. Pena was not at home. The door was locked. No further.

1909 Rawlings St20-087016 8/28/2020  11:05:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/28/2020 at 23:08 hours, Officer Michael Ortiz (83692) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1909 Rawlings St. Owen 
Smith called police stating that a black male had walked into his yard and stole three weed eater's from the bed of his truck. Mr. 
Smith began to follow the male as he ran northbound on Roanoke Ave. The male then ran westbound to N Orchard Knob Ave. The 
black male dropped two of the weed eater's at the corner of N Orchard Knob Ave/Rawlings St, and continued running southbound 
towards Robbins St. Mr. Smith described the black male as bald with rotting teeth and he was wearing a blue jacket. Mr. Smith 
stated that this male lives somewhere on Robbins St. Police searched the area but were unable to locate this party. Mr. Smith 
stated that he did wish to prosecute if the suspect was located. Nothing further at this time.

 
 

.

100 Riverside Dr20-087056 8/29/2020   2:30:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 08/29/2020 at approximately 02:35 hours, Officer M Estock (82259) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 100 
Riverside Dr. Upon arrival I made contact with Ms. Shanelle Sorensen. I observed Ms. Sorensen's vehicle /TN) in the 
middle of the road with a flat tire on the front passenger's side. I changed Ms. Sorensen's tire and sent her on her way. As she 
drove away I observed Ms. Sorensen's front driver's side tire was also flat as well. For her safety and the safety of the general 
public, I stopped Ms. Sorensen and informed her of her other damaged tire. I inspected both tires and could not find any outside 
damage to either tire. 

Ms. Sorensen informed me she bought the tires last week so there should not be any defects to the tire being brand new. Ms. 
Sorensen stated she did not recall running over anything in the road. 

Ms. Sorensen requested a property damage report be made for her two damaged tires. 

We were able to move her vehicle safely out of the roadway. I transported Ms. Sorensen to 805 Canal St. without incident. I issued 
Ms. Sorensen a case number for her report. 

No further.

6003 Shallowford Rd20-087077 8/29/2020   4:30:00AM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/29/2020 at 04:35 hours, Officer Williams (63838) responded to a Shoplifting at 6003 Shallowford Rd (Circle K). Upon arrival 
police made contact with the store clerk Amanda Morgan. Ms. Morgan stated that there was a dark complected black female with 
long black hair wearing a Red dress inside the store. The female stole a 12 pack of Bud Light beer, and 4 face mask while Ms. 
Morgan was distracted. The female passed all points of sale, and fled in a White Lincoln Town Car with a temp tag toward 
Shallowford RD. Police did observe the theft on video surveillance as described. No further at this time.

4115 Rossville Blvd20-087078 8/29/2020   4:34:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 08/29/2020 at 04:40 hours, Officer Z. Tate (79893) responded to a Vandalism at 4115 Rossville Blvd.  I arrived on scene and 
found that the drive through window to the Taco Bell at the above location had been broken out. Officers were able to contact a 
responsible, Jessica Garcia who is a manager for the location. She arrived on scene and let officers inside to search for possible 
suspects, nothing was located. No further.

4704 Rossville Blvd20-087084 8/29/2020   5:17:00AM 290 Vandalism



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/29/2020 at 05:23 hours, Officer Z. Tate (79893) responded to a Vandalism at 4704 Rossville Blvd. I arrived on scene and 
found that the drive through window to the Wendy's at the above location had been broken out. I spoke to the complainant, 
Traydarius Simms who was making a delivery stated that he observed the damage when he arrived. Mr. Simms was able to let 
officers inside the building to search for any suspects, none were located. There is no suspect info in regards to this incident.

537 Gadd Rd20-087086 8/29/2020   5:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/29/2020 at 05:55 hours, Officer JBuys (83678) reported a memo at 537 Gadd Rd. A broken down auto was reported at this 
location.  Upon arrival, Chad stated that his friend was on the way to move the vehicle. Chad and his friend were able to move the 
vehicle out of the main roadway.  Chad did not want a wreck report. Nothing further.

 
 

 
 

 

1400 Market St20-087112 8/27/2020   8:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 08/29/2020 at 10:13 hours, Officer Michael S Smith (60674) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 
1400 Market St.  Mr. Anthony called police back to report that he found his firearm.  Mr. Anthony stated that he did not realize that 
a relative had come by and cleaned his vehicle out and they packed it up and brought it to his home.  I had the firearm cleared 
from NCIC.  Nothing further to report.

7604 Standifer Gap Rd20-087113 8/28/2020  11:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 08/29/2020 at 08:37 hours, Officer Moser (60250) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 7604 Standifer Gap 
Rd. I spoke to the victim, Saron Elder who stated she came out to her vehicle this morning and noticed that someone had stolen 
the Temp tag of her vehicle.

The Temp tag was Tn  and it comes back to a 2007 Acura MDX to Saron Elder at  Standifer Gap Rd #906. 
VIN# 2HNYD28397H527973    
The tag was entered into NCIC under Nic# P487241676

1100 Lupton Dr20-087150 8/29/2020   3:22:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/29/2020 at 11:30 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) responded to a Vandalism at 1100 Lupton Dr. Upon arrival to the scene I was 
greeted by Mr. James Leeth. James informed me that overnight someone vandalized his property by doing donuts on the golf 
course. The damage caused to the putting green on hole 1 was significant. Mr. James wanted a report for his insurance claim. 
Nothing further.

490 Greenway View Dr20-087155 8/28/2020   7:20:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/29/2020 at 11:35 hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 490 Greenway View Dr. Upon 
arrival, I spoke with the victim, Mignon Morrison, who informed me she believed her debit card was stolen from Erlanger Hospital 
after leaving her personal items unattended in the break room.  Ms. Morrison stated numerous purchases were made on the card 
totaling approximately $1,020.  The major purchases were made at Walmart for 413.76 and 3 separate purchases from Speedway 
totaling $600.  The locations of the Speedways are unknown at this time.  After reviewing surveillance footage at Walmart, it was 
found the suspect was a black male with a facemask on.  The male arrived and left in a white Ford Explorer with an easily 
identifiable maroon piece of trim at the bottom of the trunk glass. Still photos of the suspect and vehicle will be attached to the 
photo section of this report.

1303 E 17th St20-087161 8/29/2020   5:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 08/29/2020 at 11:52 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a Vandalism at 1303 E 17th St. Upon arrival police spoke to 
Yoanka Smith F  who stated that an unknown person cut two of her tires so time in the early morning.

4429 Highway 5820-087173 8/29/2020  12:21:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 08/29/2020 at 12:30 hours, Officer M Pollard (63828) responded to a Vandalism at 4429 Highway 58. 

Upon my arrival at the storage facility, I spoke with the complainant, Ms. Shannon Hilbun. She showed me where the window of 
her camper had been broken. She is unsure as to when it could have occurred. She stated it has been months since she last 
checked on her camper. There were no signs of forced entry into the camper. Nothing had been removed from inside. I also spoke 
with the attendant at the facility. She stated that she was unsure as to how to work the camera system. Someone would have to 
come and review the footage. At this time there are no leads, witnesses, or suspect information.

6240 Airpark Dr20-087175 8/27/2020  12:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/27/2020 at 12:00 hours, Officer Branam (70776) reported a memo at 6240 Airpark Dr.  The caller, Douglas Keller, stated 
that he was involved in an animal related incident last Thursday (08-27-2020) in which McKamey handled the situation.  He stated 
that during the incident where his and another man's dogs fought, the other male gave verbal threats towards him.  Mr. Keller 
stated that he has since left the hotel and does not know the male's information.  Mr. Keller stated that he wanted this information 
documented.

3956 Brainerd Rd20-087196 8/29/2020   1:20:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 08/29/2020 at 13:50 hours, Officer Kilpatrick (68405) responded to a Shoplifting at 3956 Brainerd Rd (Speedway). Ms. Lewis 
(staff) reported observing an unknown black male taking two half cases of 12oz Corona Beer, and exiting the store without 
rendering proper payment. The suspect then left in a white GMC truck ( /TN). Nothing further.

 

 
 

 



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

4302 Shawnee Cir20-087226 8/29/2020   3:08:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/29/2020 at 15:15 hours, Officer Bell (79882) reported a memo at 4302 Shawnee Cir. Upon arrival I spoke with Ms. Rivers 
who told me that her mother in law, Ms. Hunter, had been calling her all day and she wanted her to stop. I asked Ms. Rivers if she 
had told her mother in law to stop, and she said that any time she brings it up, Ms. Hunter ignores her. She told me that it was 
causing stress in her life and she just wanted Ms. Hunter to stop. Ms. Rivers at one point went back inside the home, and when 
she came out, she told me that Ms. hunter had called her, and said that she would stop. No further action was needed.

7421 Commons Blvd20-087236 8/29/2020   3:00:00PM 23D Theft from Building

On 08/29/2020 at 15:54 hours, Officer Gross (84850) responded to a Theft from Building at 7421  Commons Blvd. Police spoke 
with Earlene Deeter who sated that an unknown white male approximately 50 years of age wearing an orange shirt, blue jeans, 
and a green baseball cap passed the point of sale with a number of items without paying for them.

Ms. Deeter stated that after exiting the store the unknown party left in a Chevy (TN: ) SUV in an unknown direction. Police 
searched the area but were unable to locate suspect.

The items stolen include one box of Husky contractor trash bags (valued at $17.97), one Ryobi 18V chainsaw (valued at $129), 
and one Ryobi 40V Hedge Trimmer (valued at $159).

Ms. Deeter stated that she would update police with additional video evidence when able, nothing further at this time.

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

2904 E 37th St20-087256 8/29/2020   5:02:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 08/29/2020 at 17:10 hours, I Officer M. Dunlop #526 reported a memo at 2904 E 37th St. On this date Mr. Alex Compton has 
been trespassed from this property via the property owner's request. The property owner is a Ms. Tena Clark.
No further police action was taken.

7024 Mccutcheon Rd20-087269 8/29/2020   5:37:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/29/2020 at 17:50 hours, Officer Gross (84850) reported a disorder at 7024 Mccutcheon Rd. Police spoke to complainant 
Lillard Madden who stated that he had instructed Torrance Dew to leave the Super 8 hotel property and Mr. Dew had refused. 
Police then spoke to Mr. Torrance Dew who stated that he would leave the property. Police verified Mr. Dews identity. Super 8 hote
staff stated that Mr. Dew should be trespassed from the property. Mr. Dew stated that he could no longer return to the Super 8 at 
7024 Mccutcheon Rd. Mr. Dew vacated the premises. Nothing further at this time.



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

Workman Rd//Rossville Blvd20-087295 8/29/2020   6:56:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 08/29/2020 at 18:56 hours, I Officer Goulet #385  attempted to make a traffic stop at Workman Rd / Rossville Blvd. 
I observed a Tan Pontiac Grand Ame with a white temp tag occupied by a black male traveling down Wilson Rd. I observed the 
vehicle not maintaining it's lane and would travel into on coming traffic. Possible DUI. I activated my emergency lights and the 
vehicle would not stop. The vehicle took off at a high rate of speed and made several traffic violations. The vehicle fled into 
Georgia. I did not pursue.
Nothing further

 
 
 

5505 Brainerd Rd20-087328 8/29/2020   8:03:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 08/29/2020 at 20:55 hours, Officer S. Montana (84854) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 5505 Brainerd Rd. Upon 
my arrival, I spoke with victim Eric Trimble. He stated his wallet was stolen by Elizabeth Jimenez. He stated she thinks she stole it 
because she was the only one in his room this morning around 8AM. I spoke with Ms. Jimenez and she stated he was at his room 
last night around 2200HR. She stated she remembered another lady asking Mr. Trimble if he found his wallet and he stated no. 
Ms. Jimenez allowed me to look in her purse and room but I was unable to find a wallet. Due to conflicting stories and not finding 
the wallet in Ms. Jimenez person, I was unable to locate a suspect. Nothing further at this time.

 

 
 

 

7051 Mccutcheon Rd20-087359 8/29/2020  10:32:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/29/2020 at 22:35 hours, Officer Gross (84850) reported a verbal disorder at 7051  Mccutcheon Rd. Police made contact with 
Tawanna Knowell,Tyree Moore, and Quandrila Moore who matched the descriptions given to police. All parties involved stated that 
they were not in a disorder. Police verified their identity, nothing further at this time.

5730 Carmack Rd20-087369 8/29/2020  11:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



8/23/2020  12:00:06AM TO 8/29/2020  11:59:06PM

On 08/29/2020 at 23:40 hours, Officer JBuys (83678) reported a memo at 5730 Carmack Rd. Hetchcock stated that the neighbors 
were having a loud party and there music's bass was too loud.  Spoke to the Neighbors sister, Sondra, she stated the neighbor is 
always upset with them and that she would turn the music down for the night. Nothing further.

2351 Shallowford Village Dr20-087376 8/29/2020  11:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/29/2020 at 23:40 hours, Officer J.Vasquez (79542) responded to a verbal disorder at 2351  Shallowford Village Dr. Upon 
arrival I spoke with Mr. Kebrin Quebedo who stated he was attempting to help a guest with car problems when he was approached
by Mr. Christopher Jones who began to argue with him. Mr. Quebedo stated it was all a misunderstanding and Mr. Jones came to 
apologize prior to police arrival. Nothing further.

407 Chestnut St20-087508 8/29/2020   6:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 08/30/2020 at 11:00 hours, Officer J kirk (60829) reported a memo at 407 Chestnut St. using case# 20-087508.  I spoke to 
Carma Mckoy, the complainant saying that a rubbing noise was  heard last night after the valet Brian Burger was seen driving their
truck quickly into the driveway of the Double Tree to her.  She showed me a video of them talking to Brian Burger about it last night
after it happened.  He was saying if there is any thing wrong with it he will be happy to take care of it.  
    This morning the truck owner has not heard from any one about fixing the truck.  The manager of Bird Dog Parking Johnathan 
Harris was called to talk to the couple.  He called for police to stand by because he was told that his employees were being cussed
at.  I arrived and saw Carma Mckoy driving the truck to see if it would make the noise for Johnathan to hear.  No one heard the 
noises that was heard the night before.  Every one exchanged info.  Johnathan said that he would review the videos and take care 
of what ever damage was caused if any.  There was no damage seen, heard or pointed out at this time.  No other actions could be 
taken.

7301 E Brainerd Rd20-088244 8/26/2020   5:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 09/01/2020 at 12:15 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) reported a memo at 7301  E Brainerd Rd.  Police responded to a 
delayed suspicious activity.  Upon arrival police spoke with Morgan Inga who stated on Wednesday Aug 26th she was sitting in her 
apartment when she heard someone messing with her door.  She opened the door and looked outside and saw Daniel Chance, an
employee of the apartments.  Mr. Chance was on the phone and stated to her he had the wrong apartment.  Ms. Inga waited about
a week and then was concerned Mr. Chance was trying to break in to her apartment so she reported it to management.  Police 
spoke with Katie Garrison, the apartment manager and Daniel Chance.  Both parties stated it was a misunderstanding.  Mr. 
Chance was not working at the time and had left his wallet with a resident at the apartment who he thought lived in Ms. Inga's 
apartment.  Mr. Chance went to Ms. Inga's apartment mistakenly before going to the correct apartment and retrieving his wallet.  
Mr. Chance also lives at the apartments and Ms. Inga was informed by police that it was mistake and he was not trying to break 
into the apartment.  Nothing further.




